

Ref: CCG August 025 2016

Corporate Services
NHS Liverpool Clinical Commissioning Group
The Department
Lewis's Building
Renshaw Street
Liverpool
L1 2SA

Email: foi@liverpoolccg.nhs.uk

13th September 2016,

Dear Sir/Madam,

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Thank you for your Freedom of Information request that we received on 26th August 2016, with regards to mental health services.

Request/**Response**

- 1) The amount spent from 2013/14 to 2015/16 per year, by each of the following mental health services split by NHS and independent hospitals overall:

Please note: Funding for Acute psychiatry care and PICU funding transferred to the local NHS Organisations from September 2014. These placements are now managed by the NHS provider whom contract with the independent sector hospitals on behalf of the CCG.

Please note: the costs detailed below are indicative.

- a. Acute psychiatry care

2013 - 2014

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
<i>£15,778,463</i>	<i>£847,893</i>

2014 - 2015

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
-----------------------------	-------------------------------------

£18,268,448	£353,289
--------------------	-----------------

2015 - 2016

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£20,254,479	£0

b. High secure

We are unable to provide you with the information you have requested under section 1 (1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act as we do not hold the information you have requested.

NHS England is the current commissioner of High Secure Services and as such you will need to redirect your enquiry to their Customer Contact Centre and their details are as follows:

***NHS England
Customer Contact Centre
P.O. Box 16738
Redditch
B97 9PT
Tel: 0300 311 2233
Email: england.contactus@nhs.net***

c. Medium secure

We are unable to provide you with the information you have requested under section 1 (1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act as we do not hold the information you have requested.

NHS England is the current commissioner of Medium Secure Services and as such you will need to redirect your enquiry to their Customer Contact Centre and their details are above.

d. Low secure/PICU

2013 - 2014

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£1,429,210	£869,946

2014 - 2015

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
----------------------	------------------------------

£2,192,543	£362,478
2015 - 2016	
NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£3,018,704	£0

e. Locked rehab

2013 - 2014

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£2,514,786	£0

2014 - 2015

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£2,456,957	£0

2015 - 2016

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£2,207,789	£0

f. Substance abuse

We are unable to provide you with the information you have requested under section 1 (1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act as we are not the commissioners for the service and therefore do not hold the information you have requested. This service is commissioned by NHS England and the Local Authority.

We would suggest you redirect your freedom of information request to Liverpool City Council at the following email address informationrequests@liverpool.gov.uk.

NHS England is the current commissioner of Level 1 Substance Abuse Services and as such you will need to redirect your enquiry to their Customer Contact Centre and their details are above.

g. Brain injury rehab

We are unable to provide you with all the information you have requested under section 1 (1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act as we do not hold the information you have requested.

NHS England is the current commissioner of Secure Brain Injury Rehabilitation Services and as such you will need to redirect your enquiry to their Customer Contact Centre and their details are above.

For Level 2 and 3 please see the information below:

2013 - 2014

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
<i>£2,836,924</i>	<i>£0</i>

2014 - 2015

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
<i>£2,795,428</i>	<i>£0</i>

2015 - 2016

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
<i>£2,744,151</i>	<i>£0</i>

h. Learning disabilities

We are unable to provide you with all the information you have requested under section 1 (1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act as we do not hold the information you have requested.

NHS England is the current commissioner of Tier 4 Learning Disabilities Services and as such you will need to redirect your enquiry to their Customer Contact Centre and their details are above.

For Non Secure please see the information below:

2013 - 2014

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
<i>£5,270,721</i>	<i>£1,964,161</i>

2014 - 2015

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
-----------------------------	-------------------------------------

£4,955,390	£1,983,809
-------------------	-------------------

2015 - 2016

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£4,497,765	£2,556,660

i. CAMHS

We are unable to provide you with all the information you have requested under section 1 (1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act as we do not hold the information you have requested.

NHS England is the current commissioner of Specialist CAMHS Services and as such you will need to redirect your enquiry to their Customer Contact Centre and their details are above.

For Tier 1-3 please see the information below:

2013 - 2014

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£3,159,482	£0

2013 - 2014

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£4,518,413	£0

2013 - 2014

NHS Hospitals	Independent Hospitals
£4,630,413	£0

j. Eating disorders

We are unable to provide you with all the information you have requested under section 1 (1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act as we do not hold the information you have requested.

NHS England is the current commissioner of Specialist Eating Disorder Services and as such you will need to redirect your enquiry to their Customer Contact Centre and their details are above.

Non Specialist eating disorders

2013 - 2014

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
<i>£330,438</i>	<i>£15,458</i>

2014 - 2015

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
<i>£385,110</i>	<i>£6,441</i>

2015 - 2016

<i>NHS Hospitals</i>	<i>Independent Hospitals</i>
<i>£783,763</i>	<i>£0</i>

- b. The number of patients from 2013/14 to 2015/16 per year by the hospital they are admitted to, split by the following mental health service:
- a. Acute psychiatry care
 - b. High secure
 - c. Medium secure
 - d. Low secure/PICU
 - e. Locked rehab
 - f. Substance abuse
 - g. Brain injury rehab
 - h. Learning disabilities
 - i. CAMHS
 - j. Eating disorders

The CCG does not hold this information in the format requested, therefore we are unable to respond to this question.

We do not hold the total number of patients, we are sometimes provided with number of placements or it is usually recorded as occupied bed days and not patient numbers.

We wish to take this opportunity to inform you that a formal complaints and internal review procedure is available to applicants who are unhappy with responses provided to FOI requests. You can formally request an internal review within a reasonable period of time (2 calendar months) from the date this response was issued.

Where you are not satisfied with the decision of the internal review you may apply directly to the Information Commissioners Office (ICO) for a further review of that decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted our complaints procedure in the first instance.

The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioners Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF
www.ico.gov.uk

Should you require any further information, clarification regarding this response or do not feel that your request has been answered as you would expect, please contact us to discuss.

Yours sincerely,

**Customer Relations Lead
NHS Liverpool CCG**